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Contract Number CM 1874
Bid Number NC12-009

CONTRACT FOR ASPHALT SUPERPAVE

THIS CONTRACT entered into this _13th  day of _ August , 2012, by and
between the BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF NASSAU COUNTY,
FLORIDA, a political subdivision of the State of Florida, hereinafter referred to as “County”,
and KUDZUE 3 TRUCKING, INC., P.O. Box 1799, Yulee, Florida 32041, and HUBBARD
CONSTRUCTION COMPANY, 1936 Lee Road, Winter Park, Florida 32789, hereinafter

referred to as “Vendor”.

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Nassau County, Florida received
sealed bids for Asphalt Superpave, Bid No. NC12-009, on June 14, 2012 at 2:00 p.m.; and

WHEREAS, the Road and Bridge Department determined that Kudzue 3 Trucking, Inc.
and Hubbard Construction Company were the lowest, most responsive and responsible bidders
for the bid items as set forth in Exhibit “A”; and

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the terms and conditions herein set forth, the
County and the Vendor agree as follows:
SECTION 1. Description of Services to be Provided

The County does hereby retain the Vendor to furnish materials or services as further

described in the Scope of Services attached hereto as Exhibit “B” and made a pairt hereof.
Required materials and service shall be specifically enumerated, described and depicted in the
Purchase orders authorizing performance of the specific task. This Contract standing alone does
not authorize the performance of any work or require the County to place any orders for work.

SECTION 2. Receiving/Payment/Invoicing

No payment will be made for materials ordered without proper purchése order
authorization. The County shall pay the vendor within forty-five (45) calendar days of receipt
of invoice, pursuant to and in accordance with the promulgations set forth by the State of
Florida’s Prompt Payment Act. (Florida Statutes Section 218.70). Payment shall not be made
until materials, goods or services have been received, inspected and accepted by the County in
the quality and quantity ordered. Payment will be accomplished by submission of an invoice, in
duplicate, with the Purchase Order mumber referenced thereon and mailed to the address set forth
in the Purchase Order. Payment in advance of receipt of goods or services by Nassau County

cannot be made.
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The invoice submitted shall be in sufficient detail as to item, quantity and price in order
for the County to verify compliance with the awarded bid.
SECTION 3. Acceptance of Goods/Services

Receipt of goods/services shall not constitute acceptance. Final acceptance and

authorization of payment shall be given only after a thorough inspection indicates that the
product/performance meets bid specifications and conditions. Should the products/services
differ in any respect from specifications, payment will be withheld until such time as the supplier
takes necessary corrective action. If the proposed corrective action is not acceptable to the
County, the County Manager’s Office may authorize the recipient to refuse final acceptance of
the goods/services, Should a representative of the County agree to accept the goods/services on
condition that the Vendor will correct his performance within a stipulated time period, then
payment will be withheld until the services are performed as specified.

SECTION 4. Inspection/Acceptance Title

Inspection and acceptance will be at destination unless otherwise stipulated. Title and
risk of loss or damage to all items shall be the responsibility of the Vendor until accepted by the
using department of Nassau County, unless loss or damage results from negligence by Nassau
County or it’s using Department,
SECTION S, Firm Prices

Prices for goods and services covered in the specifications shall be firm; net delivered to

the ordering agency, F.O.B. DESTINATION, vendor paying all delivery costs and shall remain
firm for the period of this Contract. No additional fees or charges shall be accepted.
SECTION 6. Fund Availability

This Contract is deemed effective only to the extent that appropriations are available.

Pursuant to Florida Statutes all appropriations lapse at the end of the Fiscal Year. Multi-year
awards shall be adequately funded but the County reserves the right not to appropriate for an
ongoing procurement if it is deemed in its best interest.

SECTION 7. Permits/Licenses/Fees

Any permits, licenses or fees required for this service will be the responsibility of the

Vendor unless otherwise stated.
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SECTION 8, Taxes

The County is tax exempt. As such, the County will not pay any Federal Excise or State

of Florida Sales Tax. The Vendor will refrain from including taxes in any billing.
SECTION 9. Laws Governing this Contract

This Contract shall be consistent with, and be governed by, the Ordinances of Nassau

County, the whole law of the State of Florida, both procedural and substantive, and applicable
federal statutes, rules and regulations. Any and all litigation arising under this Contract shall be
brought in Nassau County, Florida,

SECTION 10. Changes

The County reserves the right to order, in writing, changes in the work within the scope

of the contract, such as change in quantity or delivery schedule. The Vendor has the right to
request an equitable price adjustment in cases where changes to the contract under the authority
of this clause result in increased costs to the Vendor.

SECTION 11. Modifications

In addition to modifications made under the changes clause, this Contract may be

modified within the scope of the contract upon the written and mutual consent of both parties,
and approval by appropriate legal bodies in the County.
SECTION 12. Assignment & Subcontracting

The Vendor will not be permitted to assign its contract with the County, or to subcontract

any of the work requirements to be performed without obtaining prior written approval by the
County.
SECTION 13. Severability

If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, phrase, or portion of this Contract is, for any

reason, held invalid, unconstitutional, or unenforceable by any Court of Competent Jurisdiction,
such portion shall be deemed as a separate, distinet, and independent provision, and such holding
shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions thereof.

SECTION 14. Termination for Default

The performance of the Contract may be terminated by the County in accordance with

this clause, in whole or in part, in writing, whenever the County shall determine that the Vendor
has failed to meet performance requirement(s) of the Contract.

SECTION 15. Termination for Convenience
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The County reserves the right to terminate the Contract in whole or part by giving the
vendor written notice at least thirty (30) days prior to the effective date of the termination. Upon
receipt of termination from the County, the Vendor shall only provide those services specifically
approved or directed by the County. All other rights and duties of the parties under the Contract
shall continue during such notice period, and the County shall continue to be responsible to the
vendor for the payment of any obligations to the extent such responsibility has not been excused
by breach of default of the Vendor,

SECTION 16. Force Majeure

Neither party of this Contract shall be liable to the other for any cost or damages if the

failure to perform the Contract arises out of causes beyond the control and without the fault or
negligence of the parties. Such causes may include, but are not restricted to, acts of nature, fires,
quarantine restriction, strikes and freight embargoes. In all cases, the failure to perform must be
totally beyond the control and without any fault or negligence of the party.

SECTION 17. Access and Audits

The Vendor shall maintain adequate records to justify all charges, expenses, and costs

incurred in performing the Work for at least three (3) years after completion of this Contract.
The County and the Clerk of Courts shall have access to such books, records, and documents as
required in this Section for the purpose of inspection or audit during normal business hours, at
the County’s or the clerk’s cost, upon five (5) days’ written notice.

SECTION 18. Vendor Responsibilities

The Vendor will provide the services agreed upon in a timely and professional manner in

accordance with specifications.
SECTION 19. Public Emergencies

'The Vendor shall agree before, during, and after a public emergency, disaster, hurricane,

tornado, flood, or other acts of nature that the County shall require a “First Priority” for goods and
services, It is vital and imperative that the majority of citizens are protected from any emergency
situation that threatens public health and safety, as deterimined by the County. The Vendor agrees to
rent/sell/lease all goods and services to the county or governmental entities on a “first priority”
basis. The County expects to pay a fair and reasonable price for all products and services rendered

or contracted in the event of a disaster, emergency, hurricane, tornado or other acts of nature.
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SECTION 20. Period of Contract/Option o Extend or Renew

This Contract shall begin on the date of execution of this contract and terminate two (2)

calendar years later. The performance period of this Contract may be extended upon mutual
Contract between the vendor and the County with no change in terms or conditions. Two (2)
extensions for a period of one (1) additional year each shall be permitted under this provision.
Total contract length shall not exceed four years from date of execution. Any Contract or
amendment to the Contract shall be subject to fund availability and mutual written agreement
between the County and the Vendor.

SECTION 21. Exercise of Option

Exercise of option to extend term of contract: If the County wishes to enter into an

option peiiod, the County shall request from the Vendor their written statement of desire to enter
into an extension of the performance period.

SECTION 22. Probationary Period

The first ninety (90) days of this Contract are to be considered a “probationary™ period.

At the County’s election, this Contract may be terminated, based on the performance of the
Vendor, and a new award be granted without another formal bid.

SECTION 23. Escalation Clause

Ninety (90) days prior to the end of the contract term, the Vendor may request in writing

an increase in an individual item unit cost. Consideration of price increases at each renewal
period will be given provided such escalations are reasonable and acceptable to the County. It is
also expected that de-escalation of prices will be extended to the County if market so reflects.
The County will consider a price adjustment based on the latest Consumer Price Index and/or
proof of a manufacturer’s price increase. Any and all proposed increases are subject to approval
by the County.

SECTION 24, Supervision

The Vendor shall act as an independent contractor and not as an employee of the County.

The County shall not exercise any supervision or control over the Vendor’s employees
performing services under this Contract. Such employees shall be accountable not to the County,

but solely to the Vendor, who in turn is responsible to the County.
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SECTION 25, Indemnification and Insurance

The Vendor shall indemnify and hold harinless the County and its agents and employees

from and against all claims, damages, losses and expenses, including attorney’s fees, arising out
of or resulting from the performance of this contract, provided that any such claims, damage, loss
or expense is attributable to bodily injury, sickness, disease or death, or to loss to or destruction
of tangible property, including loss of use resulting therefrom; and is caused in whole or in patt
by any negligent or willful act or omission of the Vendor and/or Subcontractor, anyone directly
or indirectly employed by any of them or anyone for whose acts any of them may be liable.

In any and all claims against the County or any of its agents or employees, by any
employee of the Vendor, any Subcontractor, anyone directly or indirectly employed by any of
them or anyone for whose acts any of them may be liable, the indemnification obligation shall
not be limited in any way by any limitation on the amount or type of damages, compensation, or
benefits payable by or for the Vendor or any Subcontractor under Workers’ Compensation acts,
disability benefit acts, or other employee benefits act.

The vendor shall, on a primary basis, and at its sole expense, agree to maintain in full
force and effect at all times during the life of this contract, insurance coverage’s, limits,
including endorsements, as described herein. The requirements contained herein, as well as the
County’s review or acceptance of insurance maintained by the Vendor is not intended to and
shall not in any manner limit or qualify the liabilities and obligations assumed by the Vendor
under the Contract,

Workers’ Compensation: The Vendor shall agree to maintain Workers’ Compensation

Insurance and Employers Liability in accordance with Florida Statute Chapter 440. Coverage
must include Employers Liability with a minimum limit of $100,000 cach.

Business Auto Policy: The Vendor shall agree to maintain Business Automobile Liability

at a limit of liability not less than $500,000 each occurrence for all owned, non-owned and hired
automobiles. In the event the Vendor does not own any automobiles, the Business Auto Liability
requirement shall be amended allowing the Vendor to agree to maintain only Hired and Non-
Owned Auto Liability. This amended requirement may be satisfied by way of endorsement to
the Commercial General Liability, or separate business auto coverage form.

Commercial General Liability:  Commercial General Liability for public liability during the

lifetime of this Contract shall have minimum limits of $1,000,000 per claim, $2,000,000 per
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occurrence for Personal Injury, Bodily Injury, and Property Damage Liability. Coverage shall
include Premises and/or Operations, Independent Contractors, Products and/or Complete
Operations, Contractual Liability and Broad Form Property Damage Endorsements. Coverage
shall not contain an exclusion or limifation endorsement for Contractual Liability or Cross
Liability. Coverage for the hazards of explosion, collapse and underground property damage
(XCU) must also be included when applicable to the work to be performed. All insurance
policies shall be issued from a company or companies duly licensed by the State of Florida. All
policies shall be on an occurrence-made basis; the County shall not accept claims-made policies.
Specific endorsements will be requested depending upon the type and scope of work to be
performed.

Additional Insured Requirements: Certificates showing proof of the above required insurance

shall be provided to the County prior to start of this contract and shall be attached hereto as
Exhibit “C”. Except as to Workers’ Compensation and Employers’ Liability, said Certificate(s)
shall clearly state that coverage required by the Contract has been endorsed to include Nassau
County, a political subdivision of the State of Florida, its officers, agents and employees as
Additional Insured with a CG 2026-Designated Person or Organization endorsement, or similar
endorsement, to its Commercial General Liability. The name for the Additional Insured
endorsement issued by the insurer shall read “Nassau County, a political subdivision of the State
of Florida, its officers, employees and agents”. The Certificate of Insurance shall unequivocally
provide thirty (30) days written notice to the County prior to any adverse changes, cancellation,
or non-renewal of coverage thereunder. Said liability insurance must be acceptable by and
approved by the County as to form and types of coverage. In the event that the statutory liability
of the County is amended during the term of this Contract to exceed the above limits, the
contractor shall be required, upon thirty (30) days written notice by the County, to provide
coverage at least equal to the amended statutory limit of liability of the County.

SECTION 26. Disputes

Any dispute arising under this Contract shall be addressed by the representatives

of the County and the Consultant as set forth herein. Disputes shall be set forth in writing to the
County Manager with a copy to the Department Head or Consultant, depending on which party
initiates the dispute, and provided by overnight mail, UPS, FedEx, or certified mail. A response

shall be provided in the same manner prior to the initial meeting with the County Manager, the
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Department Head (or their designee), and a representative of the Consultant, This initial meeting
shall take place no more than thirty (30) days from the written notification of the dispute
addressed to the County Manager,

If the dispute is not settled at the initial meeting, the County Manager shall immediately
notify the County Attorney. The Department Head (or his/her designee), the County Attorney,
the County Manager, and the Department Head (or their designee(s)) shall meet with the
Consultant’s representative(s) within thirty (30) days of the County Manager’s notification to the
County Attorney of the continued dispute.

If there is no satisfactory resolution, the claims, disputes, or other matters in question
between the parties fo this Agreement arising out of or relating to this Agreement or breach
thereof, shall be submitted to mediation in accordance with mediation rules as established by the
Florida Supreme Court. Mediators shall be chosen by the County and the cost of mediation shall
be borne by the Consultant. If either party initiates a Cowrt proceeding, and the Court orders, or
the parties agree to, mediation, the cost of mediation shalll be borne by the Consultant,
Consultant shall not stop work during the pendency of mediation or dispute resolution. No
litigation shall be initiated unless and until the procedures set forth herein are followed.
SECTION 27. Entire Agreement

The written terms and provisions of this contract shall supersede all prior verbal

statements of any official or other representative of the County. Such statements shall not be
effective or be construed as entering into, or forming a part of, or altering in any manner
whatsoever, this Contract or contract documents.

IN WITNESS WHEREOQF, the parties have executed this contract, in two (2) copies,

each of which shall be deemed an original on this day and year first above written.




Attest as to authenticity of the
Chair’s signature:

///2/ Z/
A. CRAWFOI &g,,;
x-Officio Clerk % ¥

Approved as to form and legality by the
Nassau County Atlorney

=

DAVID A. HALLMAN
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BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
NASSAU COUNTY, FLORIDA

DANIEL B. LEEP
Its: Chair
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KUDZUE 3 TRUCKING, INC.
@ wg?/: e P W
By: \
Its:

i (L5 Qf\'ST'

STATEOF  Flovid o
COUNTY OF (\6.4s0.0

_ Beﬁn‘e me personally appeared, /@\Ow\é;u\ W\a\o 4
known " or produced -

, who is personally
as ideniification, known to be the
person described in and who executed the foregoing instrument, and acknowledged to and before
me that he/she executed said instrument for the purposes therein expressed.

WITNESS my hand and official seal, this _} ﬁmday of o bilif

, 2012,
o ?i wmela PN Ema e 5:(7
Notary Signature

iy,
SVoNELA M o

..é:\'QOHWSS/.‘c 75

AT
My Commission expires: E\fj) ( 2 (i { va

at large
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HUBBARD CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

A Zeidpuit Do

By: P. Frederick 0'Dea, Tr.
Tts: Vice President & Secretary

STATE OF Florida
COUNTY OF o0Orange

Before me personally appeared, P-Frederick 0'Dea, Jr. , who is personally

known ,/ orpreduced-- — -as-identifteation, known to be the
person described in and who executed the foregoing instrument, and acknowledged to and before

me that he/she executed said instrument for the purposes therein expressed.

~ WITNESS my hand and official seal, this % 53 day of M/ﬁq,// \f , 2012,

J/ eﬁ%&m % éé(

Notaly Slgnauue

Notary-Public-State of _ Florida at large
My Commission expires:

TVICTORIAL, CLARK b
: Nolary Public - State of Florida §

0,.1 Commission # DD 875332
Bonded Through Nauonl o ssn.
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NC12-009 Asphalt-Superpave
Bid Tabulation
Bids Opened June 14, 2012

BASIS OF AWARD: LOWEST IN TOTAL COST EVALUATION
RECOMMENDATION: NEW PRGDUCT- KUDZUE 3 TRUCKING, INC.
RECOMMENDATICN: RECYCLED PRODUCT - HUBBARD CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

EXHIBIT "A"

Oldcastle Southern
Hubbard Construction §Duval Asphalt Products,{Group.linc. dba APAC- Kudzue 3 Trucking,
Company inc. Southeast, inc. inc.
Price Price Price Price
ltem Description Price New |Recycled Price New |Recycled |Price New |Recycled
1.1 {AEP - price per gallon at plant No bid
1.2 |AEP- price per gallon at Job Site No bid
2.1 |RSI- price per gailon at Plant No bid
2.2 |R8I- price per gallon at Job Site No bid
3.0 Asphaltic: Concrete Superpave- price per:ton: delivery: made {o Nassau Couiity Vehicle SlmlE A
3.1 |Job Quantities 0-100 tons $86.00[ . /$66.00 $82.75 $72.75 $91.00
3.2 |Job Quantities 101-800 tons $86.00|, $66:00 $82.75 $72.75 $91.00 -
3.3 |Job Quantities 801-2400 tons $86.00| :$66.00 $82.75 $72.75 $81.00 -
3.4 [Job Quantities 2401 and over tons $86.00 :$66.00 $82.75 $72.75 $81.00 -
4.0 Asphaitic: Concrete: Superpave: price perfon F.0.Bifo job'sites in truck delivery to'listéd area: 7 iy i S i w
4.1 |Hilliard Area Job Qty 0-100 tons $92.00] $72.00 $05.00 $85.00 $102.00 -
4.2 |Hilliard Area Job Qty 101-800 tons $92.00| ($72:00 $95.00 $85.00 $102.00 -
4.3 |Hilliard Area Job Qiy 801-2400 tons $92.00§ $72.00 $95.00 $85.00 $102.00 -
4.4 |Hilliard Area Job Qty 2401 and over tons $92.001: : $95.00 $85.00 $102.00 -
4.5 iCaliahan Area Job Qty 0-100 tons $91.00]: - $95.00 $85.00 $100.00 -
4.6 |Callahan Area Job Qty 101-800 tons $81.00]:: $95.00 $35.00 $100.00 -
4.7 |Callahan Area Job Qty 801-2400 tons $91.00 $95.00 $85.00 $100.00 -
4.8 |Callahan Area Job Qty 2401 and over tons $91.00 $95.00 $85.00 $100.00 -
4.9 |Yulee Area Job Qty 0-100 tons $92.00 $95.00 $85.00 $100.00 -
4.10 |Yulee Area Job Qty 101-800 tons $92.00 $95.00 $85.00 $100.00 -
4.1 [ Yulee Area Job Qiy 801-2400 tons $92.00 $95.00 $85.00 $100.00 -
4.12 [Yulee Area Job Qty 2401 and gver tons $92.00 $95.00 $85.00 $100.00 ~
4.13 |Fernandina Beach Area Job Qty 0-100 tons $93.00{:: $101.00 $91.00 $102.00 -
4.14 {Fermandina Beach Area Job Qty 101-800 tons $93.00(:: $101.00 $91.00 $102.00 -
4.15 |Fernandina Beach Area Job Qty 801-2400 tons $93.00 $101.00 $91.00 $102.00 -
4.16 |Fernandina Beach Area Job Qty 2401 and over tons $93.00 : $101.00 $91.00 $102.00 : -
5.0 "Asphaitic Concrete 9.5 INSTALL: price per ton installed atjob:sites in following area locations in Nassau:County; Florida® "= :
5.4 |Hilliard Area Job Qty 0-100 tons $157.50 $135:50 $193.05 $172.44 $135.00 2 ) -
5.2 [Hiliiard Area Job Qfy 101-800 tons $113.50 $91.50 $117.89 $98.98 $113.00 910373 -
5.3 |Hilliard Area Job Qty 801-2400 tons $105.00): $83:00 $108.19 $89.28 $107.12 SUS103TI -
5.4 |Hilliard Area Job Qfy 2401 and over tons $103.00(: 1 $81.00 $108.12 $89.28 $107.12 -2 $A0373 -
5.5 |Callahan Area Job Qty 0-100 tons $156.50( 1 1 $134:50 $193.05 $172.44 $132.00 $113.00)00 -
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EXHIBIT "“A"

Oldcastle Southern
Hubbard Construction {Duval Asphalt Products,{Group,linc. dba APAC- Kudzue 3 Trucking,
Company Ine. Southeast, Inc, Inc.

Price Price Price Price
ltem Description Price New Recycied Price New |Recycled Price New |Recycled Pnce New |Recycled
5.6 |Callahan Area Job Qty 101-800 fons $112.50}: $114.44 $95.53 $110.00 $89.29|: - $103.73 -
5.7 |Callzhan Area Job Qfy 801-2400 tons $104.00[: $106.90 $87.99 $104.84 $83.83( . $103.73 -
5.8 |Callahan Area Job Qty 2401 and over tons $102.00f 0= $106.84 $87.99 $104.84 $83.83[ - $103.73 -
5.9 Yulee Area Job Qty 0-100 tons $157.500 $193.05 $172.44 $132.00 $113.00{" " $120.59 -
5.10 |Yulee Area Job Qiy 101-800 tons $113.50(: B $117.89 $98.98 $110.00 $89.29|1.'$103.73 -
5.11 [ Yulee Area Job Qty 801-2400 tons $108.00{ $108.19 $389.28 $104.84 $83.83| 7 $103.73 -
5.12 |Yulee Area Joh Qfy 2401 and over fons $103.00) . $81.00 $108.12 $89.28 $104.84 $83.83 $103.73 -
5.13 [Fernandina Beach Area Job Qty 0-100 tons $158.50]~+ - $136.50 $200.09 $179.48 $135.00 $116.00| - $120.59 -
5.14 |Fermandina Beach Area Job Qty 101-800 tons $114.50) ' $92.50 $119.62 $100.71 $113.00 $92.05[ - $103.73 -
5.15 |Fernandina Beach Area Job Qty 801-2400 fons $106.00|- ;:'i 58400 $110.78 $91.87 $107.12 $86.23[ - $103.73 -
5.16 |Fernandina Beach Area Job Qiy 2401 and over tons $104.000 70 $82:.00 $110.68 $91.87 $107.12 $86.23[ " $103.73 -
6.0 Asphaltic Concrete’ 125 INSTALL- price per.ton installed’at job sntes in following area locations in Nassai County; Florida * 70w o
6.1 {Hilliard Area Job Qty 0-100 tons $153.50}: $191.72 $166.45 $135.00 $116.00}~ - $120.59 -
8.2 [Hilliard Area Job Qty 101-800 fons $109.50 $116.67 $93.49 3113.00 $92.051 2 $103.73 -
6.3 |Hilliard Area Job Qty 801-2400 tons $100.50F $106.97 $83.79 $107.12 $86.23 - $103.73 -
6.4 |Hilliard Area Job Qty 2401 and over tons $106.91 $83.79 $107.12 $86.23} = - $103.73 -
6.5 |Callahan Area Job Qty 0-100 tons 50§ $191.72 $166.45 $129.00 $113.001 " $120.59 -
6.6 |Callahan Area Job Qty 101-800 tons $108.00p = $113.22 $90.04 $110.00 $89.29] . $103.73 -
6.7 |Callahan Area Job Qty 801-2400 tons $99.501 ¢ $105.68 $82.50 $104.84 $83.83|. = $103.73 -
6.8 |Callahan Area Job Qty 2401 and over fons $97.75) ST $105.63 $82.50 $104.84 $83.83| - +$103:73 -
6.9 |Yulee Area Job Qty 0-100 tons $163.50]" $133 50 $161.72 $166.45 $129.00 $113.00[:57:$120.59 -
6.10 |Yulee Area Job Qty 101-800 tons $109.50[: 5 - :$89:50 $116.67 $93.49 $110.00 $89.29} 510373 -
6.11 [Yulee Area Job Qty 801-2400 fons $100.50|:5:75:$80.50 $106.97 $83.79 $104.84 $83.83]::16103:73 -
6.12 |'Yulee Area Job Qty 2401 and over tons $99.00 $79:00 $106.81 $83.79 $104.84 $83.83 103:73 -
8.13 |Fernandina Beach Area Job Qiy 0-100 fons $154.50] 134.50 $198.76 $173.50 $135.00 28420359 -
6.14 [Fernandina Beach Area Job Qty 101-800 tons $110.50( $90.50 $118.40 $95.22 $113.00 *:$103 73 -
6.15 |Fernandina Beach Area Job Qty 801-2400 fons $102.00} $32.00 $109.56 $86.38 $107.12 23 T3 -
6.16 |Fernandina Beach Arez Job Qty 2401 and over tons $100.00) 10 680,00 $109.47 $86.38 $107.12 $86.23[ 3'-‘$103 73 -
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Invitation to Bid

EXHIBIT "A“

Asphaltic Concrete Superpave

NC12-009

ATTACHMENT “B” — BID PRICE SHEET'

_ BID ITEM NUMBER NCI2-009
ASPHALTIC CONCRETE-SUPERPAVE

ATP- prlca pex gall(m at Plant
1z AP~ piice per gallon at Job Site _
2,0 SRR RE R S R
21 RSmece per ggllnn at Plant
22 RS1- price per galton at Job Sife -
Descripﬁon }’uce New Pilee Reeycled
&2, -Ehlcjéc%?aw‘ H%"‘“g. 3 h.%;__\:“h:&é
| Job Quanhtnes 0-100 tony
Job Quantliles 101800 tons
Job Quandities- . §01-2460 fous
_ Job Quantifles 2401 and ovex fony ‘
PVTTINE “'GG&GRETE _ IS
gﬂ@h@;?&qﬁ%ﬁfﬁ% W s
4.1 | Hilliard Aven- Job Qnanﬁties 0-100 fons 5 BO Lo | $
4,2 Hilliayd Avea~ Job Quantities 101-809 fous $ @b Lol $
43 Hillwrd Avea- Job Quaniitics 8012400 tons $ SO | 8
4.4 Hilliard Arvea+ Job Quandities 2401 & over fons 3 so.001 8
45 Callahan Avea- Joby Quantities 0-100 tons 3 0.0l 5%
46 | Callalinu Arda- Job Quantities 101-800 tong B 0.0 B
4,7 Callahan Avea~ Job Quantities 801-2400 fons $ SO0 $
4.8 Callghan Areéa~ Job Quandifies . 2401 & ovey tous $ L CRANEY
4,9 Yulee Aven- Job Quantities _ﬁ% 0-100 tous 3 BOLn | §
410 | ¥ules Area- Job Quandities 101-800 tong 3 g0l B
431 { Wulee Avea- Job Quantities 801-2400 tons $ Bo.50] 8
442 | Yulee Aréa- Job Quantities 24901 & over tons $ 8oLl 8
413 | Fernanding Beach Aven- Job Quantiies 0-100tons 1 $ 800 %
4,14 | Fernandiug Boach Area- Job Onantitles 101-800tons | 8 BO.L0| $
415 | Fernandina Beach Areg~ Job Quantities 8612400 toms | $ Bo.01 8
4,16 | Fovnnnding Beach Avea- Job %gz;gfiﬁes 2401 & ovey tons g . 3
P TiC CONCRET B PR AV S TNSTAT T hid shall liEATE Rl s honiton
© sites grehe, 33h0\ﬂﬂ§5¥§£05§!101§;ﬁ' Hin asé?n@mm’ji}lfjmda L Elosi 3 }é‘\f‘ U
5.1 Hillinvd Avea- Job Quantities 0-300 tong $ f;w 5 ‘i ¥
5.2 Hiliiaxd Aves- Job Quantites 101-800 tong $ /0373 18
53 | Hiltiard Avea- Job Quantitics 201-2400 tous 8 /0373 1%
54 . | Hilliard Avea~ Joh Quantities 2401 & over tons 8 J03.75 |8
55 | Callahan Avea- Jobh Quantities 0300 fons $ /705918
5,6 Callahast Aveas Job Quantities 101-800 fons § [/©03.73 18
57 | Callahan Avea- Job Quantities 8012400 fony § /0375 1%
58 Callahan Avea- Job Quantities 2401 & over tony 3 /03923 18
59 | Yuleo Area- Job Quantities 0-100 tons $ S A0 5F 1§
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EXHIBIT "A"

Tnvitation fo Bid e Asphaltic Conciets Superpaye . NC12-002
510 | Yulee Aven- Job Quaniitics 101-800 tons $ J05%73 | &
511 - | Yules Avéa- Joh Quantities 801-2498 tony $ /6373 18
512 | Yulee Aven- Job Quanglites 2401, & over tons % 103 fgﬁ 8
5,13 | Feynandina Beach Area- Job Quantittes 0-100 tong $ “JAD. 3
514 | Fernandina Beach Avea- Joh Onantittes 101-800 toxis | § 0373 1% . ]
515 | Fernanding Beach Aver- Job Quantitles 801-2496 tons | § 16375 | 8
. 5.;% [fﬁrmggua Beach Aven. Job annﬁiias ; .24%13}& oyer g_)}ts | $ L2758
G0 ASPHALAIC CONCRETIR SUPERPAVE 425 INSTAULZbId i 168 ex
e B e o
61 [ Hilliard Area- Job Quantiiiey 0-100 tons $ 120.59 |3
6% Hilliard Area- Job Ouantitley 101-800 tony 3 /0373 | &
63| Hilliord Aven- Job Quantifls 8012400 foms |8 /03:73 | %
64 | Hilliavd Area- Job Quantities 2401 & over tons $_ /0325 1§
65 | Callahan Aren Job Quantites 0-100 tons 8  J2089 1%
. 6.6 | Callahan Avea- Job Quantities 101860 tons 3 /6373 |8
6.7 | Callahan Area~ Job Quantifies 8012400 tons $ /o373 13
68 | Callahan Avea- Job Quantitiey 2401 & over tons $. /68373 18
6.9 | Vulee Area- Job Quandities 0100 toxs $_  J2p.59 |8 _
G40 | Yulee Ares- Job Quantities 101-800 tons $ /6375 18
6,11 | Yuleo Avoa-~ Job Quaniities $01-2400 tons § /0373 1%
6,12 | Vuleo Avén-~ Job Quautities 2401, & oyer tons $  f0373 1%
6,13 | Fexnandina Beach Avéa- Job Quatities 0-100 fong b VAVRS 4 5
6,14 | Wernandina Beach Avea« Job Quantities 101-800ioms | $ /373 | §
615 | Fernandina Boach Avea- Job Quantities 8012400 fons { § fO373 18
6,16 | Fexnanding Beach Aves- Job Quantities 2401 & ovextons |8 /p3.73 18

Company Names j(ﬂ&tz Ue 3 Tru &’(Eiji’ ;1 Ine.
Addyess: 220 Hov | 799 —

City, State, Zip: __&}Q_L&él ;_F L. 2204

Contact Person: KR%V)A:{} mad %!

Contacts Braail Address! jsr@&zu;a 2B Uskoo.lom
Phones JON - BEE- _2‘5;53 vax:_ 904 - 384- 9,38

REMINDER: THIS FORM IS TO BE INCLUDED WITH THE BID, FAILURE TO SUBMIT ALONG
WITH BID MAY BE CAUSE FOR DISQUALIFICATION.
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EXHIBIT "AY

Invifation to Bid Asphaltie Conerete Suparpave NC12-003
ATTACHMENT “B? ~BID PRICYE SHEET
BID TIHM NUMBER NC12-009
ASPHALTIC CONCRETE-SUPERPAYVE
Hem Dezcription Prico

R

LT NS

:‘ !
l\-%"é‘%ﬁ\ﬁa e e L AT

TN

i‘\i :,vi,\, :‘3?%?5}%\\2&:& .':?(::}\:‘Q

AN

11 ABP- prics por gal[cm at Plant
12 ABP» pz‘ice pex gallon at Job Sita
2.0 SRR e R IR
Z1 BSI~ puce per ga!ien at Plant
22 RST- price per gallon at Job Slte
; }‘IEGIH e _ Desculption "’“.«f PutceNew } Puies Reoyeled
.]’ ob Qnantit:es 0-100 tong
3.2 Joh Quantliles . 101-860 tons
3 3 Job Quantities 801-2490 fons
Job Quantities 2401 aud svey fong :
"’f’gﬂ%@ AT m .'g’%eey LT SUR: L_JREAVB“‘?J" r} Sl
RICTVORY Fo Unteil hoons wbrs PR .; 3 Siad
41 | Hilllard Avea- Job Quangities 0-100 fons & : $
42 | Hillard Avea~ Job Quantities 101-809 tons § “z.em $
4.5 Hillinzd Avea~- Job Quantities 3012400 fong $§ Ya.0@ 3
44 | Ditliard Aren~ Job Quantifies 2401 & over tong §  9u.ve $
45 Callahan Arven- Job Quanilites 0-100 fons 5 et $
46 | Callahian Avea- Job Quantities 101-800 fons LG 1 Daukd 3
47 | Callahan Avea~ Job Quantities 801-2400 tons $ At e 8
4.8 | Callahgn Arer~ Job Quantifiss 2401 & overtans 3 4,%v &
49 | Yuleo Avea~ Job Quandifies 2100 tons 3 7.0 $-
410 | ¥ulee Avea~ Job Quantities 101-800 tong $ “Hz,vw 18
411 | Yuleo Aven- Job Quantities 3012400 fomy $ 4z,%¢ | §
412 | Yulee Area~ Job Quaniiiics 2401 & over topg % Cha v |8
413 | Fernandina Beach Aves- Job Quantities 0-180 fons $ 83,4 1%
4.4 | Femnauding Beach Aves- Job Quantities 101-800 fons | § q3.%¢% |8
4,15 | Fernandina Beach Area- Job Quanililes 801-2400 tong } § 3.
ﬁg)? Femandina Beach Avea- Job Quantities 2401 & oyer tong g ) b}
BIAS E, bR A e DRI Al ol N L s “," '
sifés}m the Foll %ﬁllﬁg %ﬁeaﬁﬁﬁ;\s@a&iQﬁﬁg&;ﬁﬂ nf-} e
5.3 Hilliard Avea- Job Quantifies 0-100 tong 3 I151, 5{9 $
52 | Hilliard Avea~ Job Qnantifies 101-800 fons B 113,99 3
53 Hilliard Area~ Job Quantities 301-2400 fons $ 105,00 8
54 | Hilliard Avea~ Job Quantifies 2401, & over fong $§ 1w0%.%% |8
55 { Callahan Aren~ Job Quantities 0109 tons $ 154,50 2
56 | Callalian Aven- Job Quantities 101-800 tons §  yz.®® |8
5.7 Callzhan Aven- Job Quantities 8012400 tons $ 104,*Y |8
538 | Callahan Aven- Joh Quaniities 2401 & ovor fons 3 102,918
39 | Yules Avea~ Joh Quantities 0-160 tens 3 57,30 3
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EXHI BIT erll

Invitation jo Bid Asphaltic Conerete Supespave . NCi12.009
510 | Yulke Avea- Jobh Quanfilics 101-800 fong $ ji3.%9 g )¢
531 | ¥ules Avea- Job Quanities 802-2400 tong $ ior ¢ 18 Bev
512 | Yulee Aven. Job Quantifies 9401 & ovor tons $§ 103 5  #e°
513 | Feruanding Beach Arsa- Job Quaniitics 0-100 fony $ ix 53;5‘0 3 %650
534 | Fernanding Beacli Avea- Joh Quantitles 800 tous | § JiH.56 % 9z, 80

815 | Fernanding Beach Aven~ Job Quantitley 801-240Gtons |3 (0L.5¢ $ £ L0

.16 I‘emandma Beac‘h Areni .Tob Quanhﬁes 2401 & oveyfony o I 2 o1 Mk _ Z "-"“"

AT ORI R

dob SHes e Aolio ‘ﬁng B ertza&m ' Nassay,; Gm elionda %iggh S
&1 | Hillaxd Avea- Job Quanhﬁes 0-100 tems 3 8 T3
0,2 | Hiltard Avegs Joh Quandities 101-800 {ons 5 {049,5Y 3 & %.5¢
0.3 | Hilkard Avea- Job Quantities 3012408 fons 3 ieD.5Y 3 B, 450
6.4 | Hillard Area~ Job Quantitles 2401 & over tons $  qH,9° § 9,
6,5 Callalan Aven- Job Quantittes - <100 tons & 152,50 | & (B2 50
6,6 | Callahan Avea- Job Quaniities 104-800 fous T K a4 w0
67 | Callaban Avea- Job Quantities 8012400 fons $ 99,50 1% 9,50
68 | Caltalan Avea- Joh Quantitles 2401 & over toug $ 4%15 13 N ad
69 | Yulee Avea Job Qpantities $-100 tons 3 153,50 | & § 3,50
610 | Yules Aven- Joh Quantities 101808 fons 5 109,59 1% 89,59
631 | Yulee Avep~ Job Quanfities 8012400 fong b3 106,58 | & G0, 5¢
6.12 | Vuleo Avea- Job Quantiles 2401 & over tons $ G.9¢ " [§ . 74,00
0.3 | Fernanding Beach Aven~ Job Quantitles 3100 tons & i34 50 18 24,50
6.14 | Fernanding Boack Area- Job Quaniities 101-8300¢oms | $ Ho, 20 18 q6.59
615 | Fernandina Beach Avea- Job Quantifies 3012400 {ons | tpz.0¢ 18 72,40
616 _ | Weynanding Beach Area- Job Quantifles 2401 & ovextons | § Peg:0% 1§ fa, £

Compary Name: Hubbard Construction Gompany

Gity, Stﬂfﬁ;Zip} Winter Pai‘k, FL 32789

Contact Person: David Rey

Contact’s Dusil Address: david.rey@hubbard.com

Phemer __407--645-5500 T, 407-623-3865

REMINDER: THIS FORM IS T0 BE INCLUDED WITH THE BID, FAILURE TO SUBMIT AT.ONG
WITHBID ¥IAY BE CAUSE FOR DISQUALIFICATION,
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Contract Number CM1874
RRid Number NC12-009

EXHIBIT “B”

TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS/SCOPE OF WORK
BID NUMBER NC12-009

1. Duration of Bid: Two (2) years with two (2) optional one (1) year extensions.

2. The payment due date for a local governmental entity for the purchase of goods or
services other than construction services is 45 days per Florida Statutes Section 218.74.

3. Price quotes are to be F.O.B. to destination.

4, All charges must be indicated on the Bid Sheet. If not, Nassau County will have the
authority to reject those charges.

5. Complete description and specifications of product must accompany each and every bid.

6. All materials shall conform to Section 334 of the current FDOT Standard Specifications
for Road and Bridge Construction and FDOT Roadway and Traffic Design Standards
Index.

7. Apply Asphaltic Concrete Superpave 9.5 or 12.5 as designated by the County
Engineering Department.

8. All performance and work shall be in accordance with Florida Department of
Transportation construction procedures and methods.

9. All fees for Maintenance of Traffic shall be included in the unit prices for Milling, ST and
SIII Install and Asphalt Services.

10. Jobs shall be completed within 30 days after the purchase orders are received.

11. Inspection and acceptance shall be made by the Nassau County Engineering Department.

12. Bidders are required to the fill out the attached Bid Sheet.
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ACORD
V

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE ;... 1 of 1

Crrigqf

DATE (MIVDDIYYYY)
07/03/2012

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS AMATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(les)must be endorsed. I[f SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to
the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certiticate does not confer rights to the

certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER EOAMNE{\CT
Willis of Michigan, Inc, PHONE FAX
c/c 26 Century Blvd. (A NO ExT):_B77-945-7378 (AC.No): 888-467-2378
P. 0. Box 305131 ACDAESS: certificates@willis.com
Nashville, T™N 37230-5191
INSURER(S)AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
INSURER A: Arch Insuvance Company 11150-001
INSURED Hubbard Construction Company INSURERB: XL Insurance America 24554-091
The Hubbard Group, Inc. INSURERC: Great American Insurance Company 16691-005
P.0. Box 547217 o
oxlando, FL 32854 INSURERD:
INSURERE:
| INSURERF:
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: 18191182 REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERICD
INDICATED, NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPEGT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN. THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN 1S SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

INSR ADD'L SUBH

1IR TYPE OFINSURANCE NSRO WYD POLICY NUMBER POngg EFF ﬁﬁd&&’ﬁﬁn LIMITS
A | GENERALLIABILITY Y 41PKG32440603 10/1/2011 (10/1/2012 | EACHOCCURRENCE $ 2,000,000
X | COMMERGIAL GENERALLIABILITY A L ionce) |8 1,000,000
—| CLMMS-MADEE OCCUR MEO EXP (Any one petson) $ 50,000
L PERSONAL & ADV INJURY $ 2,000,000
__j GENERAL AGGREGATE $ 4,000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: PRODUCTS-COMPIOPAGG 13 4,000,000
j POLIGY rx_l 5&?{ I_—l LOG 5
A | AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY ¥ 41PKG2440603 10/1/2011 [10/3/2012 [ homany e tMET e 2,000,000
% | anvauto BODILY INJURY{Per parson) 1%
] ALLOWNED SCHEQULED BODILY INJURY({Per accident) ($
Z HIRED AUTOS RN QWNED FPZ?;’CE_Z‘I)JAMAGE s
$
B |X | umBRELLALIAB | X | OCCUR US00035889LI11A 10/1/2011 |10/1/2012 | EACHOCCURRENCE $ 10,000,000
EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE $ 10,000,000
DED |  [RETENTIONS s
A | WORKERSCOMPENSATION i 41WCI2440503 10/1/2011 [10/1/2012 X | oeoimbs ] o0,
gﬁ;{ggg&n&aﬁy&%{ﬁggfgecwwe N/A E.L.EACHAGCIDENT s 1,000,000
ﬁ.;aegfigloryfnla E.L. DISEASE-EAEMPLOYEE |§ 1,000,000
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E.L DISEASE-POLIGYLIMIT [§ 1,000,000
c MAC8185883 107172011 [10/1/2012
Equipment Floater All Leased &
Blanket AlLl Rented Equipment
Risk Coverage Daductible §25,000

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS [ LOCATIONG/ VEHICLES {Attach Acord 101, Additonal Remarks Schedule, If move space is required)
Re: Nassau County Asphalt Superpave Bid No. NC12-009

Excess Liability Follows Form

Nassau County,

a Political Subdivision of the State of Florida,
are included as Additional Insureds as respects to General Liability and Auto Liability.

its officers, employees and agents

CERTIFIGATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

Naggau County

Board of County Commissioners
96135 Nassau Place, Suite 6
Yulee, FL 32097

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREQF, NOTICE WL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

UTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

I ) Mo

Coll:3783550 Tpl:1343106 Cert: i&lQIiaz
The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD

ACORD 25 {2010/05)

©1888-2010 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.




THIS ENDORSEMENT CHANGES THE POLICY. PLEASE READ IT CAREFULLY.
ADDITIONAL INSURED — AUTOMATIC STATUS WHEN REQUIRED BY A
CONSTRUCTION AGREEMENT WITH YOU — COMPLETED OPERATIONS -
PRIMARY AND NON-CONTRIBUTORY ENDORSEMENT

This endorsement modifies insurance provided under the following:

Section I - Who is an “Insured” is amended to include as an insured any person or
organization for whom you are performing operations when you are specifically required
by a written construction contract or agreement with such person or organization to
include them as an additional insured on your policy and provide coverage for such
additional insured only for liability arising out of:

i)y “your work” at the location designated; or
i) The “products completed operations hazard.”

Coverage afforded to these additional insured parties will be primary to, and non-
contributory with, any other insurance available to that person or organization.

All other terms and conditions of this Policy remain unchanged.

Policy Number: 41PKG2440603
Named Insured: Hubbard Construction Company

This endorsement is effective on the inception date of this Policy unless otherwise
stated herein:

00MLO01S 00 08 06 Pagelorl




THIS ENDORSEMENT CHANGES THE POLICY. PLEASE READ IT CAREFULLY
ADDITIONAL INSURED ENDORSEMENT
This endorsement modifies insurance provided under the following.
BUSINESS AUTO COVERAGE FORM

With respect to coverage provided by this endorsement, the provisions of the Coverage Form apply
unless modified by the endorsement.

This endorsement is effective on the inception date of the policy unless another date is indicated below.

SECTION I — LIABILITY COVERAGE, 1. WHO IS AN INSURED is amended to include as an “insured”
the person(s) or organization{s) named in the Schedule below, but only with respect to their legal liability
for acts or omissions of a person for whom Liability Coverage is afforded under this policy. You are
authorized to act for the additional insured named in the Schedule in all matters pertaining to this
insurance.

SCHEDULE

Name and address of Additional Insured:
ANY PERSON OR ORGANIZATION THAT YOU HAVE AGREED IN A WRITTEN CONTRACT, THAT
SUCH PERSON OR ORGANIZATION 1S AN ADDITIONAL INSURED ON THIS POLICY.

All other terms and conditions of this policy remain unchanged.

Endorsement Number:
Policy Number: 41PKG2440603
Named Insured: Hubbard Construction Company

Endorsement Effective Date: 10/1/2011 local Standard Time at the First Named Insured's

00 CAGD70 60 09 06




THIS ENDORSEMENT CHANGES THE POLICY. PLEASE READ IT CAREFULLY.

NOTICE OF CANCELLATION — CERTIFICATE HOLDERS
(SPECIFIED DAYS)

The person{s) or organization(s) listed or described in the Schedule below have requested thatf they
receive written notice of cancellation when this pelicy is cancelled by us. We will mail or deliver to the
Person(s) or Organization(s) listed or described in the Schedule a copy of the written notice of
cancellation that we sent to you. [f possible, such copies of the notice will be mailed at least 30 days,
except for cancellation for non-payment of premium which will be mailed 10 days, prior to the seffecfive
date of the cancellation, to the address or addresses of certificate holders as provided by your broker or
agent,

Schedule

Person(s) or Organization(s) including mailing address:
Nassau County

Board of County Comimissioners

96135 Nassau Place, Suite 6
Yulee, FL. 32097

This notification of cancellation of the policy is intended as a courtesy only. Our failure to provide such
notification to the person(s) or organization{s) shown in the Schedule will not extend any policy
cancellation date nor impact or negate any canceflation of the policy. This endorsement does not entitie
the person(s) or organization(s) listed or described in the Schedule above to any benefit, rights or
protection under this policy.

Any provision of this endorsement that is in conflict with a statute or rule is hereby amended to conform to
that statute or rule.

All other terms and conditions of this policy remain unchanged.

Endorsement Number:

Policy Number: 41PK(G2440603

Named Insured: Hubbard Construction Gompany
This endorsement is effective on the inception date of this Policy unless otherwise stated herein:

Endorsement Effective Date: 10/1/2011

00 ML0O87 00 11 10 Page 1 of 1




THIS ENDORSEMENT CHANGES THE POLICY. PLEASE READ IT CAREFULLY.

NOTICE OF CANCELLATION — CERTIFICATE HOLDERS
(SPECIFIED DAYS)

The person(s) or organization(s) listed or described in the Schedule below have requested that they
receive written notice of canceilation when this policy is cancelled by us. We will mail or deliver to the
Person{s} or Organization(s) listed or described in the Schedule a copy of the writien notice of
cancellation that we sent to you. If possible, such copies of the notice will be mailed at least 30 days,
except for cancellation for non-payment of premium which will be mailed 10 days, prior to the effective
date of the cancellation, to the address or addresses of certificate holders as provided by your broker or

agent.

Schedule

Person{s) or Organization(s) including mailing address:
Nassau County

Boatd of County Commissioners

96135 Nassau Place, Suite 6
Yulee, FL. 32097

This naotification of cancellation of the policy is intended as a courtesy only. Qur failure to provide such
notification to the person(s) or organization(s) shown in the Schedule will not extend any policy
cancellation date nor impact or negate any cancellation of the policy. This endorsement does not entitle
the person(s) or organization{s} listed or described in the Schedule above to any benefit, rights or
protection under this policy.

Any provision of this endorsement that is in conflict with a statute or rule is hereby amended to conform to
that statute or ruie.

All other terms and conditions of this policy remain unchanged.

Endorsement Number:

Policy Number: 41WCI|2440503

Named Insured: Hubbard Construction Company

This endorsament is effeclive on the inception date of this Policy uniess otherwise stated herein:

Endorsement Effective Date: 10/1/2011

00 MLC087 00 11 10 Page 1 of 1




ACORD> CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE o
THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER, THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXYEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTﬁ A CONTRACT. BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHOR!ZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, 'AND THE CERTIFIGATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: i the ‘certificate holdor is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy{fes) mustbe endorsad. If SUBROGATION 18 WAIVED, subject to

the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policles may mqu!re an endorsemant. A statement on this ceruﬁcata doss not confer rights to the
certificate holder in lieu of such andorsement{s) . ‘ . )

PRODUCER SONIACT  Marqaret Trew ™ L .
Greene & Associates IO lO0N 2020 P (904 2622302
PO Rox 1880 - I78kEss, _ albgreenciisurancitom - e .
Middleburg, FI 32050 R NWWG_CQM( 1 e
' , . _ __\wsurera: Continental Casualty -~ ‘ ok ]
WHSURED © | msure s . Continental Caspalty ‘ : L
Kudzue 3 Trucking Inc | BSURER G Traaspona!fonlnsumncei:o L
P O Box 1799 | pisurern: Travelers Pro _@ﬂy&CaMCoofmnenm
Yulee F1 32041 . ,pggum_f.______________ e e i . o
: |msurerE: MT

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: - REVISIOH NUHBER‘

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED.NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDIGATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRAGT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
.CERTIFICATE MAY BE |SSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY.THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES, LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE SBEEN REDUCED BY PAID ¢ C-LAIMS

TR TYPE OF MISURANCE m__mm___' mm’m LIATTS,
GENERAL LIABRLITY . : ) T §4,000,000
A ix] ROIAL GENERAL LABILITY _ P A 15 eonoca - | €300,000-
cumis e [X] ocour 2095918230 031012 103HOM3 | Meni i 5,000
] B iy | £1,000000
- 200004}0
_Qg]mascae LMITAP IES PER: ] 32000,000
LOC is
Aurouomsmau.m - 151,000,000
B Hmmo . : : T _S' :
X ) A Wm" |C2095918244 031wz [03HOM3 . aoowim«mdem) 3
| X | nieo auros ,\uros ' WA s
510,000
- UMBRELLA LAB occuﬂ $. 0
EXCESS LAS m&&w&e s
WORKERS COMPENSATION s» . ] s o
. ::geunovsns-mmm C‘-’"‘ﬁ o . N & 313@'000
c ( ,2“"”“’5! R‘uﬂ"w’gﬁ"a‘m"ﬁwm“ ‘ HIA ' w041§9777f4 12731114 12!31:"12 ~ s‘LOOB.OGO
3 L R - s 4 s-:jlmtm
Gontractors Equipment 660-6612X943 |03ron2 (031013
D . ' - o
. o j. . R
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES {Attach ACORD m.m Remarks Schedula, [ more space IV rsq-.wod)
_1Nassau Couinty, a political subdivisionpf the State of Florida, it$ ofﬁcers, agents and employees as
Additional Named Insured form GG 2026 aHached,
CERTIFICATE HQ_&QER CANGELLATRON .
oty Sowdof Gty mm?;“m%wms T
Comimnisstoners . . ACCORDAKCE WITH ms Poucv Pnowsrons, : :
96135 Nassau Place Suite 8 - o .
Yuled, FL3209T <>
Phone: {904M491-7317
| Fax: (9043212658

@ 1988-2010 AGORD CORPORA‘HON. Allrights f‘esarved
; AGORD 25 (2010/05) The ACORD name and togo ara ragistered marks of ACORD -






